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NEW LEGISLATION 
 

March 23, 2020 
 
Temp. No. Introduced Committee  Description 
 
No new legislation  



CALENDAR 
 

March 23, 2020 
 
The following legislation will be up for passage at the Council Meeting on March 23, 2020. 
 
Temp. No.  Introduced   Committee  Description 
A-15 3/9/20 PZ An ordinance approving the application of 

Amy Mothersbaugh and Gary Blaine, as 
owners of certain real property located at 
2190 Sourek Trail (Parcel Nos. 35-06778 
and 35-01535), to place said property 
into an agricultural district pursuant to 
Ohio Revised Code Chapter 929, and 
declaring an emergency. 

 
A-16 3/9/20 FIN Authorizing the Mayor, as Safety 

Director, to sell to the City of Stow, Ohio, 
certain used Fire Department equipment, 
and declaring an emergency. 

 



PENDING LEGISLATION 
 

March 23, 2020 
 
Temp. No.  Introduced Committee  Description 
 
B-93  11/25/19 PI An ordinance authorizing the Mayor, as 

Director of Public Safety, to enter into a 
contract or contracts, according to law, 
for the installation of a new roof at Fire 
Station 4, located at 3089 Northampton 
Road, and declaring an emergency. 

 
A-15 3/9/20 PZ An ordinance approving the application of 

Amy Mothersbaugh and Gary Blaine, as 
owners of certain real property located at 
2190 Sourek Trail (Parcel Nos. 35-06778 
and 35-01535), to place said property 
into an agricultural district pursuant to 
Ohio Revised Code Chapter 929, and 
declaring an emergency. 

 
A-16 3/9/20 FIN Authorizing the Mayor, as Safety 

Director, to sell to the City of Stow, Ohio, 
certain used Fire Department equipment, 
and declaring an emergency. 

 
 


