(Prices are firm unless noted otherwise.)

2022 Chemical Bid Tabulation - City of Cuyahoga Falls, Ohio

Sodium Hydroxide

Chemical Liquid Chlorine Liquid Orthophosphate Fluorosilicic Acid ) Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite
(Caustic Soda)
Specs NSF Certified NSF Certified NSF Certified NSF Certified NSF Certified
Packaging 1-Ton cylinders 50-55 gal carboy 2-4,500 gallon deliveries 14-3,600 gal.devliveries 5-55 gal carboy
2022 Total Quantity 55 - Ton cylinders 6,600 gal 46 tons 184 dry tons 275 gal
cost 5 each cost cost cost cost
. A Drum Cost
Bidder per cylinder Total Cost per Drum Cost Total Cost per Total Cost per Total Cost per 2) Total Cost
ton deposit gal ton dry ton gallon
Bonded Chemicals, Inc.
2645 Chart St., Columbus, OH no bid $8.70 N/A $57,420.00 no bid $999.00 $183,816.00 $2.19 N/A $602.25
Paul Cochran
JCl Jones Chemicals, Inc.
2500 Vanderhoof Rd., Barberton, OH $1,400.00 [ $750.00 | $80,750.00 no bid no bid $785.00 $144,440.00 no bid
Nicole Tuma & & *% *k
Pencco, Inc.
PO Box 600, San Filipe, TX no bid no bid $589.50 $27,117.00 no bid no bid
Sarah Duffy
Sal Chemical Co., Inc.
3036 Birch Dr., Weirton, WV no bid $9.86 N/A $65,076.00 no bid $1,173.80 $215,979.20 $1.89 N/A $519.75
Eric Hurlburt *okok *% % * %k *k ¥ * %k * %k
Shannon Chemical Corporation
PO Box 376, Malvern, PA no bid $9.17 N/A $60,522.00 $877.77 $40,377.42 no bid no bid
Kim D'Ambrosio
Univar USA, Inc.
1686 E. Highland Rd., Twinsburg, OH no bid no bid $480.00 $22,080.00 $1,019.00 $187,496.00 no bid

Shelley Riggle

* Price subject to change after 03/31/2022 upon 30 day written notice

** Price subject to change upon 30 day written notice

*** Price firm 01/01/2022 - 12/31/2022, plus one year extension if mutually agreed upon

Awarded Bids

Notes: 1. Liquid Chlorine to be rebid after 03/31/2022 if bidder's unit price changes.
2. Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda) awarded to lowest bidder with firm price.




